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Freedom of Information request reference number: 7606.1 

 

Date of response: 11/07/2023 

 

Request: 

 

Since September 2021, how many meetings have taken place between the London Fire Brigade and 

RUSS, ROOFF, Lewisham Council and/or others regarding the fire safety of the RUSS building project 

at Church Grove SE13? Please include in-person meetings, phone calls, Zoom meetings etc, and 

provide dates, names of those attending, meeting notes and any outcomes." 

 

‘RUSS and ROOFF will make sure to provide the LFB with all the detailed design information request on 

the renewed attention to the 12 Church Grove project.' Please confirm that the LFB was thus provided 

with this information and provide any subsequent related correspondence, e.g. from LFB to RUSS or 

ROOFF, accordingly." 

 

Response: 

 

Further to your request, I have requested information held by LFB on Church Grove, SE13. There is a 

record of a meeting taking place on the 22nd September 2021. Please see below for a record of the 

Agenda including some briefing notes. We do not hold a central audit history, so do not hold 

information of further meetings taking place.  

 

I can also confirm that LFB have received details of the design plan, which was received on 22 March 

2021. We have no record of any updated design plans after this date. A response was provided by LFB 

on the 8th August 2021. Please see below for a redacted copy of the correspondence. Personal 

information has been removed from the agenda and report under section 40 of the FOIA – Personal 

Information. 

 

We have dealt with your request under the Freedom of Information Act 2000. For more information 

about this process please see the guidance we publish about making a request on our website: 

https://www.london-fire.gov.uk/about-us/transparency/request-information-from-us/ 
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From:   
Sent: 13 September 2021 16:23 
To:  

 
Cc:  

 
Subject: Re: Approval for wording of agenda for LFB/Church Grove meeting 22 September. 

Hello again, 

Here is a tweaked version of the agenda. Thanks for your input earlier today – I hope this works better. 

, do let me know if you’re happy with item 3 on the agenda – I thought it would be very brief, a 
way of concluding the meeting by looking to the future and a chance for you to mention (repeating the 
info given at last week’s meetings) how very regulated construction traffic will be, with the booked 
delivery slots and banksmen. But I’m also happy to pull it if you’d rather be an observer at the meeting – 
it’s fine either way. 

 

 

 

 

1) A draft agenda so that we can add our items as necessary prior to finalising 

Agenda 

Purpose of meeting with LFB on 22 September: to respond to queries about access for fire appliances 

from Ladywell Road to 12 Church Grove. We hope that a team from Lewisham Fire Station will be in 

attendance with a fire appliance but this will depend upon their availability on the day.  

1. Introductions (All) 

2. Demonstration and discussion of fire appliance access to Church Grove and turning circle on 12 

Church Grove site (LFB) 

3. Outline of steps to be taken to ensure emergency access is maintained during construction 

(ROOFF) 

Notes 

1. The dimensions of Church Grove (kerb to kerb and parking bay to kerb) can be found in the 

attached document Fire Appliance Access Technical Note, p.4.  

2. Questions relating to the design of the building (e.g. materials, method of construction, provision of 

sprinklers) are beyond the scope of this meeting and are covered by the Building Control process.  
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All households 1-20 Church Grove have been invited, along with  and . 

The attending officer from LFB is an Inspecting Officer  with the 

contact emai  

.  

3) What you have sent the LFB by way of briefing 

The draft agenda and the Fire Appliance Access Technical Note.  

4) That the meeting will be a round-table event (e.g. in the hub), not just a huddle at the work 

site 

The meeting will take place on the 12 Church Grove site. The hub will be available if needed. 

 

  

The meeting is scheduled for up to 60 minutes. Notes will be taken by RUSS and shared with 

attendees, Lewisham Strategic Development Team and any Church Grove residents unable to attend.  

6) That a representative from  and Council Planning will attend 

 is not available on the date that was most convenient for the LFB. Notes will be shared 

with  Representatives from Lewisham Planning have not been invited, following the indication of 

 who advised by email on 3 August: 

I do not consider that the Planning Service can help you further with the matters you raise and 

I also encourage you to liaise with the Approved Inspector who is responsible for addressing 

matters of fire safety going forward. 

Lewisham Council Strategic Development Team have been kept informed of this meeting and of all 

correspondence on this matter. 

[ENDS] 
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