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Freedom of Information request reference number: FOIA3656.1
Date of response: 20 February 2018
Request and Response:

1. In 2017, how many applications were submitted to you by the Local Authority Planning permission/
Building Control departments in your area for comment & advice?

We have record of receiving 10999 applications in 2017 (01.01.2017 - 31.12.2017).

2. Could you provide a breakdown of the numbers (i.e. how many applications from each local authority in
your area).

D jobs 1 JAN - 31 DEC 2017
Total D

Borough Jobs
Barking and Dagenham Count 86

Barnet Count 319
Bexley Count 117
Brent Count 263
Bromley Count 259
Camden Count 780
City of London Count 902
Croydon Count 283
Ealing Count 360
Enfield Count 163
Greenwich Count 152
Hackney Count 371
Hammersmith and Fulham Count 358
Haringey Count 210
Harrow Count 127
Havering Count 153
Hillingdon Count 251
Hounslow Count 265
Islington Count 447
Kensington and Chelsea Count 378
Kingston upon Thames Count 157
Lambeth Count 355
Lewisham Count 167
Merton Count 154
Newham Count 278




Redbridge Count 147
Richmond upon Thames Count 164
Southwark Count 473
Sutton Count 159
Tower Hamlets Count 509
Waltham Forest Count 142
Wandsworth Count 301
Westminster Count 1749
Total 10999

3. Do you keep records of the advice you give?

A copy of the response letter (satisfactory/unsatisfactory) is kept on the individual premises file within our
fire safety records.

4. How many of those applications (2017), in your opinion, did not meet your advised specifications &
guidance?

We do not hold this information.

5. As far as you know how many applications were granted regardless of your advice not having been met
i.e. where a difference of opinion occurred?

We do not hold this information.

| hope you find the information provided of use. If you have any further questions do let me know.
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